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QUESTION 1

You are upgrading Computer1 and Computer2 from Windows NT Workstation 4.0 to Windows 2000 Professional. You
successfully upgrade Computer1. During the upgrade of Computer2, a series of power outages interrupts the
upgrade.You discover that the upgrade of Computer2 is incomplete. Furthermore, you find that Computer2 can no
longer run Windows NT Workstation 4.0. Computer2 does not support booting from the Windows 2000 Professional CD-
ROM. You decide to use Computer1 to help recover the failed upgrade.What should you do? 

A. On Computer1, copy the CD-ROM driver and the system files named Ntdetect.com, Ntbootdd.sys, Ntdll.dll, and
Setupldr.bin to a formatted floppy disk. On Computer2, restart the upgrade by using the floppy disk. Then run Winnt32
/debug from the Windows 2000 Professional CD-ROM. 

B. On Computer1, copy the CD-ROM driver and the system files named Ntdetect.com, Ntbootdd.sys, Ntdll.dll, and
Setupldr.bin to a formatted floppy disk. On Computer2, restart the upgrade by using the floppy disk. Then run Winnt32
/rx from the Windows 2000 Professional CD-ROM. 

C. On Computer1, run Makebt32.exe from the Bootdisk folder on the Windows 2000 Professional CD- ROM. On
Computer2, restart the upgrade by using the newly created floppy disks. 

D. On Computer1, perform a remote installation from a network share. On Computer2, when the text portion of Setup
has completed, resume the installation by using Setup Manager. 

Correct Answer: C 

 

QUESTION 2

You are the network administrator for your company. An employee named Bruno uses a Windows 2000 Professional
portable computer. When he starts the computer, Windows 2000 prompts him to select in either a docked or an
undocked mode. Bruno primarily works out of the office and does not use a docking station when he is in the office. He
asks you to configure his portable computer so that it will not prompt him to select a docked or an undocked mode.What
should you do? 

A. Modify the portable computers BIOS settings, and disable support for the docking station. 

B. Modify the portable computers hardware profiles, and remove the Docked hardware profile. 

C. Modify the portable computers device settings to disable the Unplug Devices icon in the system tray. 

D. Modify the portable computers hardware profiles, and position the Docked hardware profile at the top of the list of
hardware profiles. 

Correct Answer: B 

 

QUESTION 3

Your Windows 2000 Professional computer has 10 shared folders that are available to other network users. A user
reports that he cannot access a shared folder named ShareA.You want to respond to the user\\'s problem as quickly as
possible by using an administrative tool. However, you cannot remember the server location of ShareA.What should you
do? 

A. Use Windows Explorer to display the file paths of your shared folders. 
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B. Use Storage in Computer Management to view logical drive properties. 

C. Use Event Viewer in Computer Management to search for shared folder error messages. 

D. Use System Tools in Computer Management to display the file paths of your shared folders. 

Correct Answer: D 

 

QUESTION 4

You want to connect your Windows 2000 Professional computer to a new color laser printer. The printer is Plug and
Play compliant. The printer is included on the current Hardware Compatibility List (HCL).You are a member of the Sales
organizational unit (OU). You want to share the printer with other users in the Sales OU.You plug the printer into the
LPT port on the back of the computer. You then attempt to install the 32- bit application printer software that came with
the printer. During the installation, you receive an error message as shown in the exhibit. (Click the Exhibit button.)What
should you do before you share the printer with other users in the Sales OU? 

A. Change the LPT port setting to enable legacy Plug and Play detection on your computer. 

B. Change the LPT port setting to bidirectional in the BIOS on your computer. Then reinstall the printer software. 

C. Connect the printer to another computer in the Sales OU. Then install the device drivers for the printer. 

D. Obtain and install the WDM-compliant device drivers and printing software for the printer. 

Correct Answer: D 

 

QUESTION 5

You configure your Windows 2000 Professional computer for Internet connection Sharing and for TCP/IP filtering as
shown in the exhibit. (Click the Exhibit button.)You test your TCP/IP filtering configuration from another client computer.
You can access Web sites, but you cannot access FTP sites.What should you do to be able to access FTP sites? 
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A. Add Port 21 to the TCP Ports section. 

B. Add Port 138 to the TCP Ports section. 

C. Add Port 21 to the IP Ports section. 

D. Add Port 138 to the IP Ports section. 

Correct Answer: A 
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