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QUESTION 1

An administrator needs to stop flow F1 deployed on execution group EG1 on broker TEST without affecting other
runtime components. What command does the administrator need to use? 

A. mqsistopmsgflow TEST -e EG1 -f F1 

B. mqsistopmsgflow TEST -e EG1 -m F1 

C. mqsistopmsgflow TEST.broker -e EG1 -j 

D. mqsistopmsgflow TEST.broker -e EG1 -m F1 

Correct Answer: B 

 

QUESTION 2

A BAR file Solutionv1.bar has been deployed. The developer created a BAR file Solutionv2.bar to meet new business
requirements and asked the administrator to deploy it. The content of these BAR files is listed below. Content of the file
Solutionv1.bar: MsgFlow1.cmf MsgFlow2.cmf MsgSet1.dictionary MsgSet2.dictionary Content of the file Solutionv2.bar:
MsgFlow1New.cmf MsgFlow3.cmf MsgSet1.dictionary MsgSet3.dictionary The administrator performed a successful
incremental deployment to an execution group. What artifacts are in the execution group? 

A. MsgFlow1New.cmfMsgFlow3.cmfMsgSet1.dictionaryMsgSet3.dictionary 

B. MsgFlow1New.cmfMsgFlow1.cmfMsgFlow2.cmfMsgSet1.dictionaryMsgSet2.dictionary 

C. MsgFlow1.cmfMsgFlow2.cmfMsgFlow3.cmfMsgSet1.dictionaryMsgSet2.dictionaryMsgSet3.dictionar y 

D. MsgFlow1New.cmfMsgFlow1.cmfMsgFlow2.cmfMsgFlow3.cmfMsgSet1.dictionaryMsgSet2.dictiona
ryMsgSet3.dictionary 

E. MsgFlow1New.cmfMsgFlow1.cmfMsgFlow2.cmfMsgFlow3.cmfMsgSet1.dictionaryMsgSet2.dictiona
ryMsgSet3.dictionary 

F. MsgFlow1New.cmfMsgFlow1.cmfMsgFlow2.cmfMsgFlow3.cmfMsgSet1.dictionaryMsgSet2.dictiona
ryMsgSet3.dictionary 

G. MsgFlow1New.cmfMsgFlow1.cmfMsgFlow2.cmfMsgFlow3.cmfMsgSet1.dictionaryMsgSet2.dictiona
ryMsgSet3.dictionary 

H. MsgFlow1New.cmfMsgFlow1.cmfMsgFlow2.cmfMsgFlow3.cmfMsgSet1.dictionaryMsgSet2.dictiona
ryMsgSet3.dictionary 

I. MsgFlow1New.cmfMsgFlow1.cmfMsgFlow2.cmfMsgFlow3.cmfMsgSet1.dictionaryMsgSet2.dictiona
ryMsgSet3.dictionary 

Correct Answer: DEFGHI 
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QUESTION 3

A company has the following WebSphere Message Broker 6.0 components installed in its environment. Oracle 10g
Release 2 WebSphere MQ V7.0.0 Rational Agent Controller V5.0.2.1 Java Runtime Environment V5 To migrate to
WebSphere Message Broker V 7.0, the administrator needs to update: 

A. Java Runtime Environment V5 to V6. 

B. Oracle 10g Release 2 to 11g Release 1. 

C. IBM WebSphere MQ V7.0.0 to V7.0.1. 

D. IBM WebSphere MQ V7.0.0 to V7.0.1 and Rational Agent Controller V5.0.2.1 to V6.0. 

Correct Answer: C 

 

QUESTION 4

An administrator has defined a new IMSConnect configurable service and deployed the message flow to the appropriate
execution group. After the deployment, it was identified that the execution time-out value within the configurable service
was set too low. What MUST the administrator do to resolve this? 

A. Change the properties of the configurable service (mqsichangeproperties) and then restart the broker. 

B. Change the properties of the configurable service (mqsichangeproperties) and then restart the execution group. 

C. Delete the IMSConnect configurable service (mqsideleteconfigurableservice) and redefine
(mqsicreateconfigurableservice) withnew values and then restart the broker. 

D. Delete the IMSConnect configurable service (mqsideleteconfigurableservice) and redefine
(mqsicreateconfigurableservice) withnew values including the redeployment of the message flow to the execution
group. 

Correct Answer: A 

 

QUESTION 5

An administrator is asked to write an Administration API (CMP API) based application for monitoring the message
broker environment. What are prerequisites to run Java applications that use the CMP API? 

A. A configuration manager API (CMP API) Exerciser. 

B. A Java Development Kit (JDK) at a supported Java level. 

C. A WebSphere MQ queue manager running on the server. 

D. A local broker running on that environment to connect to remote brokers. 

E. The WebSphere MQ Classes for Java added to classpath. 

Correct Answer: BE 
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