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QUESTION 1

During a Guardium deployment planning meeting, the team decides to deploy all S-TAP agents on all Unix/ Linux
database systems. A Unix/Linux system administrator team manager asks a Guardium administrator if there are any
differences between Guardium S- TAPs for AIX and Linux systems that the team should be aware of. 

What should be the Guardium administrator\\'s response? 

A. A-TAP is required on all AIX DB Servers. 

B. aserver reboot is required to capture shared memory traffic from all databases on AIX. 

C. K-TAP is required on the AIX DB servers. The exact uname -a output is required to determine the correct K-TAP
module for the server. 

D. K-TAP is required on the Linux DB servers. The exact uname -a output is required to determine the correct K-TAP
module for the server. 

Correct Answer: B 

 

QUESTION 2

An administrator has a new standalone Guardium appliance that will be placed into production next week. The
appliance will monitor traffic from a number of databases with a high volume of traffic. The administrator needs to
configure the schedule to ensure the appliance internal database does not get full with incoming data. 

Which data management function does the administrator need to configure? 

A. Purge 

B. Data Export 

C. Data Restore 

D. System Backup 

Correct Answer: A 

 

QUESTION 3

During a Guardium deployment planning meeting, a database administrator indicated that the mission critical databases
were clustered. How should the Guardium administrator handle S-TAP installation and configuration with respect to
clustered databases? 

A. Install S-TAP agents on all active nodes. Set ALL_CAN_CONTROL=1 to failover the S- TAP process to the passive
nodes when a database failover occurs. 

B. install S-TAP agents on all active nodes Set WAIT_FOR_DB_EXEC=-1 to set the agent process to failover to the
passive node when a database failover occurs. 

C. Install S-TAP agents on all active and passive nodes. Set ALL_CAN_CONTROL=0 to disable all passive nodes until
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a database failover occurs. 

D. Install S-TAP agents on all active and passive nodes: Set WAIT_FOR_DB_EXEC>0 on all nodes to start S-TAP
processes without waiting for a correct DB home. 

Correct Answer: A 

 

QUESTION 4

A Guardium administrator needs to use CLI commands to maintain the internal database, clean static orphans, produce
static system reports and to monitor live network traffic filtered by IP addresses and port numbers. 

Which combination of commands should the administrator use for these tasks? 

A. diagandiptraf 

B. diag and trace_route 

C. jptrafandsupport must_gather 

D. support must_gatherandshow network verify 

Correct Answer: C 

 

QUESTION 5

AGuardium administrator is checking the scheduled jobs exceptions report on a standalone Collector The 

following error is repeating every 15 minutes. 

java.lang.NumberFormatException: empty String 

The administrator also notices that the anomaly detection polling interval is 15 minutes. 

What should the administrator do next to contribute troubleshooting the problem? 

A. Pause all scheduled jobs and check if the exception comes back. 

B. identify the alert that is causing the problem by deactivating one alert at a time. 

C. Check in the alert builder to see which alerts have accumulation interval of 15 minutes. 

D. in the CLI run support must_gather aggjssues and send the file to IBM support. 

Correct Answer: B 

 

QUESTION 6

A Guardium administrator needs to build new appliances with the latest version of Guardium. How should the
administrator obtain the ISO image? 
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A. Contact IBM Support. 

B. Download fromibm.com 

C. Download from IBM Fix Central. 

D. Download from IBM Passport Advantage. 

Correct Answer: D 

 

QUESTION 7

Auditors request a report of all unsuccessful login attempts to a database monitored by Guardium. How should a
Guardium administrator create such a report? 

A. Add a failed login rule to the policy. 

B. Create a failed login query and report using access domain in Guardium. 

C. Create a failed login query and report using exceptions domain in Guardium. 

D. Create a failed login query and report using application data domain in Guardium. 

Correct Answer: C 

 

QUESTION 8

AGuardium administrator is using the Classification, Entitlement and Vulnerability assessment features of the product.
Which of the following are correct with regards to these features? (Select two.) 

A. Vulnerability Assessment reports are populated to the Guardium appliance via S-TAP. 

B. Classification for databases and files use the same mechanisms and patterns to search for sensitive data. 

C. Entitlement reports are predefined database privilege reports and are populated to the Guardium appliance via S-
TAP. 

D. Vulnerability Assessment identifies and helps correct security vulnerabilities and threats in the database
infrastructures. 

E. The classification feature discovers sensitive assets including credit card numbers or national card numbers from
various data sources. 

Correct Answer: DE 

 

QUESTION 9

A Guardium administrator needs to monitor changes to the Oracle configuration file on a production Oracle database
server. Assuming all valid licenses are applied, which Guardium component does the administrator need to install and
where? 
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A. Guardium Installation Manager (GIM) on the Database Server 

B. Configuration Auditing System (CAS) on the Database Server. 

C. Configuration Auditing System (CAS) on the Guardium Collector. 

D. Configuration Auditing System (CAS) on the Database Server and on the Guardium Collector. 

Correct Answer: D 

 

QUESTION 10

An infrastructure manager is presented with a few new servers that are available to deploy as a Guardium Collector
appliance as part of Guardium project expansion. The Guardium administrator is asked which server option is best for a
Guardium Collector. Which server option can the Guardium administrator use for the new Collector? 

A. ja64 Intel Processor with quad-core CPU, 32GB memory, 4 NICs, 2TB disk 

B. x86_64 Intel Processor with 8-core CPU, 32GB memory, 2 NICs, 1 TB disk 

C. x86_64 Intel Processor with dual-core CPU, 24GB memory, and 2 NICs, and 200GB disk 

D. Iinuxppc64 Power Processor with 8-core CPU, 24GB memory, and 4 NICs, and 4TB disk 

Correct Answer: B 
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